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ADVERTISEMENT FOR THE POST OF CONTRACTUAL CONSULTANTS 

(Advertisement No. CBMR/RCT/002/2022) 

The Centre of Biomedical Research (CBMR) Lucknow invites applications/nominations for 

exceptionally bright and motivated candidates at the post of consultants on contractual basis 

in the following areas. Application/nomination should be sent in the prescribed format with 

supporting documents. 

 

1) Medical. 

Consultant: 01 Post on contractual (Un-Reserved):- Post Code:- M2021C02U 

Essential Qualifications & Experience: vuqHkoh@vodk’k izkIr fof’k"V oSKkfud ;k fdlh 

fof’k"V {ks= esa n{k fo’ks"kKA MBBS/MD degree with at least 05 years working experience. 

Superannuated Medical Doctors with the above experience may also apply. 

Pay:-Fixed emoluments of Rs. 40,000 /- (per month) 

 

2) Bio-Statistics. 

Consultant: 01 Post on contractual (Un-Reserved):- Post Code:- B2021C02U 

Essential Qualifications & Experience: vuqHkoh@vodk’k izkIr fof’k"V oSKkfud ;k fdlh 

fof’k"V {ks= esa n{k fo’ks"kKA PhD in Statistics with experience in biostatistics/ patient related 

data analysis. Superannuated candidates with the above experience may also apply. 

Pay:-Fixed emoluments of Rs. 40,000 /- (per month). 
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3) Graphic Designing. 

Consultant: 01 Post on contractual (Un-Reserved):- Post Code:- GD2021C02U 

Essential Qualifications & Experience: vuqHkoh@vodk’k izkIr fof’k"V oSKkfud ;k fdlh 

fof’k"V {ks= esa n{k fo’ks"kKA Bachelor in fine-arts (BFA) with at least 5 years of experience in 

Scientific Graphic Designing and branding with work experience in a scientific organization. 

Superannuated candidates with the above experience may also apply. 

Pay:-Fixed emoluments of Rs. 40,000 /- (per month). 

 

GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS: 

Note:- Those candidates who have already applied against the advertisement No. 

CBMR/RCT/002/2022, need not apply again. 

❖ Period of Engagement: -The consultant will be appointed initially for a period of two (02) 

years and after performance evaluation their tenure will be renewed annually upto a 

maximum of five (05) years. 
 

Last date for receipt of hard copy of 
application 

30.04.2022 

Cut-off Date for determining the qualification and Experience limit will be the 01stJanuary, 
2022. 

Web link to see advertisement and form: https://cbmr.res.in 

 
 

❖ Application format is available at Centre's website (https://cbmr.res.in).  
Application/nomination duly completed on prescribed form should be sent, with copies of 
proofs of educational/academic qualifications, experience, testimonials, research publications 
etc, as indicated there in. 

 

❖ Application should be sent through email at recruitment@cbmr.res.in with send by speed 
post/courier. The envelope must be super-scribed with the name of post and area applied for 
with advertisement No. and addressed to the ‘Director, Centre of BioMedical Research 
(CBMR), SGPGIMS Campus, Raebareli Road, Lucknow-226014, Uttar Pradesh, INDIA’. 
Applications by hand will not be entertained. If the last date of submission of application is a 
holiday, the application will be accepted till 5:00 PM on the next working day. 

 

❖ The number of posts indicated are provisional and subject to change without prior notice. 
Selections may not be held for all the advertised posts. Director of the Centre reserves the 
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right to reject any or all applications without assigning any reason. All disputes will be subject 
to the jurisdiction of the Lucknow bench of Hon`ble High Court of Judicature at Allahabad. 

❖ Incomplete applications will not be considered and will be treated as disqualified. 
 

❖ No. TA/DA shall be admissible for attending the interview. 
 

❖ Only matriculation/SSC Certificates issued by the concerned educational board will be 
considered as proof of date of birth. 

 

❖ Candidates must ensure before applying that they are eligible according to the criteria 
stipulated in the advertisement. If a candidate is found ineligible at any stage of recruitment 
process, he/she will be disqualified and their candidature will be cancelled. 

 

❖ Concealment of facts/information or submitting false information will disqualify the 
candidature at any stage of recruitment. 

 

❖ The Centre reserves the right to revise/reschedule/cancel/suspend the recruitment process 
without assigning any reason. The decision of the Centre shall be final and no appeal in this 
regard shall be entertained. 

 

❖ Candidates are advised to visit the website regularly for information related to the recruitment 
process. 

 

❖ Candidates will be intimated by email regarding the date of interview. Original documents 
will be verified at the time of interview. 

 

❖ These posts are purely contractual in nature and the candidate have no right to claim 
permanent appointment on the above posts. 

 

Director 
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